RE: E911 VOTE REQUIRED November Accounts Payable

Gabriel Moreno <gmoreno@tadems.com>
Tue 11/29/2022 9:56 AM

To: Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>;Derek Navarette <navarette@lasosheriff.org>;Charles Glorioso
<charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>;Dave Bacharach <dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>;Buddie Curro
<buddiecurro@gmail.com>;Mally Blecha <mallyl7@comcast.net>;Rick Kumm <rickjohnkumm@gmail.com>;John Jenkins
<sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>;Mike Tihonovich <mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>

YES

Gabriel Moreno, ASM, NRP
Executive Director/EMS Chief
Trinidad Ambulance District
939 Robinson Ave

Trinidad, CO 81082

From: Barbara Fisk

Sent: Tuesday, November 29, 2022 9:42 AM

To: Gabriel Moreno <gmoreno@tadems.com>; Derek Navarette <navarette @lasosheriff.org>; Charles Glorioso
<charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>; Dave Bacharach <dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>; Buddie Curro
<buddiecurro@gmail.com>; Mally Blecha <mallyl7 @comcast.net>; Rick Kumm <rickjohnkumm@gmail.com>; John
Jenkins <sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>; Mike Tihonovich <mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>

Subject: E911 VOTE REQUIRED November Accounts Payable

Importance: High

PLEASE "REPLY TO ALL" WITH YOUR YES/NO VOTE TO PAY THE ACCOUNTS PAYABLE AS
LISTED. I've also attached the October Financial Statement which will be officially reviewed at the January
meeting where this email will also be read into the minutes.

Barbara Fisk

Office Manager

Trinidad Ambulance District
P. O. Box 132

939 Robinson Avenue
Trinidad, CO 81082
(719)846-6886
www.tadems.com

This communication is intended only for the recipient(s) named above, may be confidential and/or

legally privileged: and, must be treated as such in accordance with state and federal laws. If you are not

the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use of this communication, or any of its contents,

is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please return to sender and delete the

message from your computer system. s ) /
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Re: E911 VOTE REQUIRED November Accounts Payable

Mike Tihonovich <mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>
Tue 11/29/2022 10:00 AM

To: Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>;Gabriel Moreno <gmoreno@tadems.com>;Derek Navarette
<navarette@lasosheriff.org>;Charles Glorioso <charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>;Dave Bacharach
<dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>;Buddie Curro <buddiecurro@gmail.com>;Mally Blecha <mallyl7@comcast.net>;Rick Kumm
<rickjohnkumm@gmail.com>;John Jenkins <sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>

YES

Lieutenant Michael W. Tihonovich

Trinidad Police Department

160 E First Street

Trinidad, CO 81082

Dispatch: (719) 846-4441

Office: (719) 846-2993 Ext 303 Cell: (719) 859-5097
FAX: (719) 846-3453

www.trinidadpolice.org https.//www.trinidad.co.gov/police-department

From: Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 29, 2022 9:41 AM

To: gmoreno <gmoreno@tadems.com>; Derek Navarette <navarette@Iasosheriff.org>; Charles Glorioso
<charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>; Dave Bacharach <dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>; Buddie Curro
<buddiecurro@gmail.com>; Mally Blecha <mallyl7 @comcast.net>; Rick Kumm <rickjohnkumm@gmail.com>; John
_lJenkins <sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>; Mike Tihonovich <mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>

Subject: E911 VOTE REQUIRED November Accounts Payable

PLEASE "REPLY TO ALL" WITH YOUR YES/NO VOTE TO PAY THE ACCOUNTS PAYABLE AS
LISTED. I've also attached the October Financial Statement which will be officially reviewed at the January
meeting where this email will also be read into the minutes.

Bavrbowra Fisk

Office Manager

Trinidad Ambulance District
P. 0. Box 132

939 Robinson Avenue
Trinidad, CO 81082
(719)846-6886
www.tadems.com

This communication is intended only for the recipient(s) named above, may be confidential and/or
legally privileged: and, must be treated as such in accordance with state and federal laws. If you are not
the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use of this communication, or any of its contents,
is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please return to sender and delete the
message from your computer system.



RE: E911 VOTE REQUIRED November Accounts Payable

Dave Bacharach <dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>
Tue 11/29/2022 10:58 AM

To: Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>;Gabriel Moreno <gmoreno@tadems.com>;Derek Navarette
<navarette@lasosheriff.org>;Charles Glorioso <charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>;Buddie Curro <buddiecurro@gmail.com>;Mally
Blecha <mallyl7@comcast.net>;Rick Kumm <rickjohnkumm@gmail.com>;John Jenkins <sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>;Mike Tihonovich
<mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>

Yes

From: Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 29, 2022 9:42 AM

To: gmoreno <gmoreno@tadems.com>; Derek Navarette <navarette@Ilasosheriff.org>; Charles Glorioso
<charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>; Dave Bacharach <dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>; Buddie Curro
<buddiecurro@gmail.com>; Mally Blecha <mallyl17 @comcast.net>; Rick Kumm <rickjohnkumm@gmail.com>; John
Jenkins <sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>; Mike Tihonovich <mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>

Subject: E911 VOTE REQUIRED November Accounts Payable

Importance: High

PLEASE "REPLY TO ALL" WITH YOUR YES/NO VOTE TO PAY THE ACCOUNTS PAYABLE AS
LISTED. I've also attached the October Financial Statement which will be officially reviewed at the January
meeting where this email will also be read into the minutes.

Bavbora Fisk

Office Manager

Trinidad Ambulance District
P. 0. Box 132

939 Robinson Avenue
Trinidad, CO 81082
(719)846-6886
www.tadems.com

This communication is intended only for the recipient(s) named above, may be confidential and/or
legally privileged: and, must be treated as such in accordance with state and federal laws. If you are not
the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use of this communication, or any of its contents,
is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please return to sender and delete the
message from your computer system.



Re: E911 VOTE REQUIRED November Accounts Payable

Mally Blecha <mallyl7@comcast.net>
Tue 11/29/2022 12:19 PM

To: Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>

Cc: Gabriel Moreno <gmoreno@tadems.com>;Derek Navarette <navarette@lasosheriff.org>;Charles Glorioso
<charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>;Dave Bacharach <dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>;Buddie Curro <buddiecurro@gmail.com>;Rick
Kumm <rickjohnkumm@gmail.com>;John Jenkins <sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>;Mike Tihonovich <mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>

Vote yes, Mally Blecha

Sent from my iPad

On Nov 29, 2022, at 9:41 AM, Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com> wrote:

PLEASE "REPLY TO ALL" WITH YOUR YES/NO VOTE TO PAY THE ACCOUNTS PAYABLE AS
LISTED. I've also attached the October Financial Statement which will be officially reviewed at the January
meeting where this email will also be read into the minutes.

Barbowvra Fisk

Office Manager

Trinidad Ambulance District
P. 0. Box 132

939 Robinson Avenue
Trinidad, CO 81082
(719)846-6886
www.tadems.com

This communication is intended only for the recipient(s) named above, may be confidential and/or
legally privileged: and, must be treated as such in accordance with state and federal laws. If you are not
the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use of this communication, or any of its
contents, is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please return to sender and
delete the message from your computer system.




RE: E911 VOTE REQUIRED November Accounts Payable

john jenkins <sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>

Tue 11/29/2022 12:07 PM

To: Derek Navarette <navarette@lasosheriff.org>;Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>;Gabriel Moreno
<gmoreno@tadems.com>;Charles Glorioso <charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>;Dave Bacharach
<dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>;Buddie Curro <buddiecurro@gmail.com>;Mally Blecha <mallyl7@comcast.net>;Rick Kumm
<rickiohnkumm@gmail.com>;Mike Tihonovich <mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>

yes

Sent from Mail for Windows

From: Derek Navarette

Sent: Tuesday, November 29, 2022 11:01 AM

To: Barbara Fisk; Gabriel Moreno; Charles Glorioso; Dave Bacharach; Buddie Curro; Mally Blecha; Rick Kumm; John
Jenkins; Mike Tihonovich

Subject: RE: E911 VOTE REQUIRED November Accounts Payable

Yes

pHEHRIE,

Derek J. Navarette
Sheriff

Las Animas County Sheriff's Office
2309 E. Main St

Trinidad, CO 81082

-1 (7191 546-2211 v Ext 111 Work
navarette@lasosheriff.org

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail communication and any attachments may contain proprietary and privileged information for the use
of the designated recipients named above.

Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited.

If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the
original message

From: Barbara Fisk [mailto:barbara.f@tadems.com]

Sent: Tuesday, November 29, 2022 9:42 AM

To: Gabriel Moreno <gmoreno@tadems.com>; Derek Navarette <navarette@Iasosheriff.org>; Charles Glorioso
<charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>; Dave Bacharach <dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>; Buddie Curro
<buddiecurro@gmail.com>; Mally Blecha <mally17 @comcast.net>; Rick Kumm <rickjohnkumm@gmail.com>; John
Jenkins <sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>; Mike Tihonovich <mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>

Subject: E911 VOTE REQUIRED November Accounts Payable

Importance: High

PLEASE "REPLY TO ALL" WITH YOUR YES/NO VOTE TO PAY THE ACCOUNTS PAYABLE AS
LISTED. I've also attached the October Financial Statement which will be officially reviewed at the January
meeting where this email will also be read into the minutes.

Barbora Fisk



Re: E911 VOTE REQUIRED November Accounts Payable

Charles Glorioso <charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>
Tue 11/29/2022 9:48 AM
To: Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>

Charles J. Glorioso, Chief of Police
CITY  TRINIDAD

160 E. First Street

Trinidad, CO 81082

(719) 846-2993, ext. 202

From: Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 29, 2022 9:41 AM

To: gmoreno <gmoreno@tadems.com>; Derek Navarette <navarette@Ilasosheriff.org>; Charles Glorioso
<charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>; Dave Bacharach <dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>; Buddie Curro
<buddiecurro@gmail.com>; Mally Blecha <mally17 @comcast.net>; Rick Kumm <rickjiohnkumm@gmail.com>; John
Jenkins <sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>; Mike Tihonovich <mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>

Subject: E911 VOTE REQUIRED November Accounts Payable

PLEASE "REPLY TO ALL" WITH YOUR YES/NO VOTE TO PAY THE ACCOUNTS PAYABLE AS
LISTED. I've also attached the October Financial Statement which will be officially reviewed at the January
meeting where this email will also be read into the minutes.

Barbawrow Fisk

Office Manager

Trinidad Ambulance District
P. O. Box 132

939 Robinson Avenue
Trinidad, CO 81082
(719)846-6886
www.tadems.com

This communication is intended only for the recipient(s) named above, may be confidential and/or
legally privileged: and, must be treated as such in accordance with state and federal laws. If you are not
the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use of this communication, or any of its contents,
is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please return to sender and delete the
message from your computer system.



October 2022 Financial Statement (attached)

Accounts Payable November 2022

Barbara Fisk $1,500
Century Link $66.90
Century Link ESINet $3,159.32 Finance Charge

Century Link Annual Extract $650.00
City of Trinidad $8,333.33

IAED — Mandi EMD Recert $55.00

Motorola Solutions $15,701.18 (two consolettes quoted/ordered 11/2021)
Mountain States Financial $750.00 (2021 audit preparation)

The Chronicle News $59.16 (re-advertise budget hearing)

The Computer Kernel $880.00

These emails have been approved by the board and entered into the minutes on
January 26, 2023.

(M e January 26, 2023

A= | -
Gabriel Moreno, Chairperson




