E911 Bills for December Payment

Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>

Mon 12/19/2022 1:54 PM

To: Gabriel Moreno <gmoreno@tadems.com>;Derek Navarette <navarette@lasosheriff.org>;Charles Glorioso
<charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>;Dave Bacharach <dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>;Buddie Curro
<buddiecurro@gmail.com>;Mally Blecha <mallyl7@comcast.net>;Rick Kumm <rickjohnkumm@gmail.com>;John Jenkins
<sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>;Mike Tihonovich <mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>

Hi All,

I've prepared the following bills for payment (in alphabetical order lol). Since the NENA invoice is not
monthly but annual, I will need permission to pay it. Please respond as soon as possible. Checks will be
prepared for signature and distribution on Thursday, December 22nd.

e Barbara Fisk $1500

e Century Link ESInet $3,008.88 éa;éé’ '\/,

o Century Link 2 lines $67ish (not yet received) -Dﬁfﬂ/( ~ y

e City of Trinidad $3,333.37 (last payment for 2022) % . }/

o IMEG $480 (GIS mapping Sept-Nov) 6 i -

e Mitn States Financial $250 \Du){,’ ._}/'

e NENA 911 $147 (annual membership)

¢ The Computer Kernel $880 :Bw&{g/

Mally =y

Barbowaw Fisk Rork -
Office Manager !
Trinidad Ambulance District j-,;}l[ 7
P. O. Box 132 \ '
939 Robinson Avenue M’ /< e- )/
Trinidad, CO 81082 28 :
(719)846-6886
www.tadems.com M . 0

This communication is intended only for the recipient(s) named above, may be confidential and/or
legally privileged: and, must be treated as such in accordance with state and federal laws. If you are not
the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use of this communication, or any of its contents,
is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please return to sender and delete the
message from your computer system.



Re: E911 Bills for December Payment

Gabriel Moreno <gmoreno@tadems.com>
Mon 12/19/2022 10:17 PM

To: Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>;Derek Navarette <navarette@lasosheriff.org>;Charles Glorioso
<charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>;Dave Bacharach <dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>;Buddie Curro
<buddiecurro@gmail.com>;Mally Blecha <mallyl7@comcast.net>;Rick Kumm <rickjohnkumm@gmail.com>;John Jenkins
<sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>;Mike Tihonovich <mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>

Okay

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>

Sent: Monday, December 19, 2022 2:54:01 PM

To: Gabriel Moreno <gmoreno@tadems.com>; Derek Navarette <navarette @lasosheriff.org>; Charles Glorioso
<charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>; Dave Bacharach <dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>; Buddie Curro
<buddiecurro@gmail.com>; Mally Blecha <mallyl7@comcast.net>; Rick Kumm <rickjohnkumm@gmail.com>; John
Jenkins <sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>; Mike Tihonovich <mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>

Subject: E911 Bills for December Payment

Hi All,

I've prepared the following bills for payment (in alphabetical order lol). Since the NENA invoice is not
monthly but annual, I will need permission to pay it. Please respond as soon as possible. Checks will be
prepared for signature and distribution on Thursday, December 22nd.

Barbara Fisk $1500

Century Link ESInet $3,008.88

Century Link 2 lines $67ish (not yet received)
City of Trinidad $3,333.37 (last payment for 2022)
IMEG $480 (GIS mapping Sept-Nov)

Mitn States Financial $250

NENA 911 $147 (annual membership)

The Computer Kernel $880

Bavrbarow Fisk

Office Manager

Trinidad Ambulance District
P. 0. Box 132

939 Robinson Avenue
Trinidad, CO 81082
(719)846-6886
www.tadems.com

This communication is intended only for the recipient(s) named above, may be confidential and/or
legally privileged: and, must be treated as such in accordance with state and federal laws. If you are not
the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use of this communication, or any of its contents,
is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please return to sender and delete the
message from your computer system.



Re: E911 Bills for December Payment

Rick Kumm <rickjiohnkumm@gmail.com>

Mon 12/19/2022 9:27 PM

To: Mally Blecha <mallyl7@comcast.net>

Cc: Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>;Gabriel Moreno <gmoreno@tadems.com>;Derek Navarette
<navarette@lasosheriff.org>;Charles Glorioso <charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>;Dave Bacharach
<dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>;Buddie Curro <buddiecurro@gmail.com>;John Jenkins <sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>;Mike Tihonovich
<mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>

Approved.

On Mon, Dec 19, 2022, 15:47 Mally Blecha <mallyl7@comcast.net> wrote:
Barb, okay by me to pay the necessary NENA bill, Mally Blecha

On 12/19/2022 1:54 PM Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com> wrote:

Hi All,

I've prepared the following bills for payment (in alphabetical order lol). Since the NENA invoice is not
monthly but annual, I will need permission to pay it. Please respond as soon as possible. Checks will be
prepared for signature and distribution on Thursday, December 22nd.

Barbara Fisk $1500

e Century Link ESInet $3,008.88

o Century Link 2 lines $67ish (not yet received)
City of Trinidad $3,333.37 (last payment for 2022)
IMEG $480 (GIS mapping Sept-Nov)

Mtn States Financial $250

NENA 911 $147 (annual membership)

The Computer Kernel $880

Barbara Fisk

Office Manager

Trinidad Ambulance District
P. 0. Box 132

939 Robinson Avenue
Trinidad, CO 81082
(719)846-6886
www.tadems.com

This communication is intended only for the recipient(s) named above, may be confidential and/or
legally privileged: and, must be treated as such in accordance with state and federal laws. If you are
not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use of this communication, or any of its
contents, is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please return to sender and
delete the message from your computer system.




Re: E911 Bills for December Payment

Mally Blecha <mallyl7@comcast.net>
Mon 12/19/2022 3:47 PM

To: Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>;Gabriel Moreno <gmoreno@tadems.com>;Derek Navarette
<navarette@lasosheriff.org>;Charles Glorioso <charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>;Dave Bacharach
<dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>;Buddie Curro <buddiecurro@gmail.com>;Rick Kumm <rickjohnkumm@gmail.com>;John Jenkins
<sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>;Mike Tihonovich <mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>

Barb, okay by me to pay the necessary NENA bill, Mally Blecha

On 12/19/2022 1:54 PM Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com> wrote:

Hi All,

I've prepared the following bills for payment (in alphabetical order lol). Since the NENA invoice is not
monthly but annual, I will need permission to pay it. Please respond as soon as possible. Checks will be
prepared for signature and distribution on Thursday, December 22nd.

e Barbara Fisk $1500

Century Link ESInet $3,008.88

e Century Link 2 lines $67ish (not yet received)
City of Trinidad $3,333.37 (last payment for 2022)
IMEG $480 (GIS mapping Sept-Nov)

Mtn States Financial $250

NENA 911 $147 (annual membership)

The Computer Kernel $880

Barboawraw Fisk

Office Manager

Trinidad Ambulance District
P. 0. Box 132

939 Robinson Avenue
Trinidad, CO 81082
(719)846-6886
www.tadems.com

This communication is intended only for the recipient(s) named above, may be confidential and/or
legally privileged: and, must be treated as such in accordance with state and federal laws. If you are not
the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use of this communication, or any of its
contents, is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please return to sender and
delete the message from your computer system.




Re: E911 Bills for December Payment

Derek Navarette <navarette@lasosheriff.org>
Mon 12/19/2022 3:32 PM

To: Dave Bacharach <dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>

Cc: Mike Tihonovich <mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>;Charles Glorioso <charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>;Barbara Fisk
<barbara.f@tadems.com>;Gabriel Moreno <gmoreno@tadems.com>;Buddie Curro <buddiecurro@gmail.com>;Mally Blecha
<mallyl7@comcast.net>;Rick Kumm <rickjohnkumm@gmail.com>;John Jenkins <sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>

Ok

Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 19, 2022, at 2:00 PM, Dave Bacharach <dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov> wrote:

Ok

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Mike Tihonovich <mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>

Sent: Monday, December 19, 2022 1:56:55 PM

To: Charles Glorioso <charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>; Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>; gmoreno
<gmoreno@tadems.com>; Derek Navarette <navarette@lasosheriff.org>; Dave Bacharach
<dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>; Buddie Curro <buddiecurro@gmail.com>; Mally Blecha <mally17 @comcast.net>;
Rick Kumm <rickjohnkumm@gmail.com>; John Jenkins <sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: E911 Bills for December Payment

Ok

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Charles Glorioso <charles.glorioso@trinidad.co.gov>

Sent: Monday, December 19, 2022 1:55:07 PM

To: Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>; gmoreno <gmoreno@tadems.com>; Derek Navarette
<navarette@lasosheriff.org>; Dave Bacharach <dave.bacharach@trinidad.co.gov>; Buddie Curro
<buddiecurro@gmail.com>; Mally Blecha <mally17@comcast.net>; Rick Kumm <rickjohnkumm@gmail.com>; John
Jenkins <sfpdjenkins@gmail.com>; Mike Tihonovich <mike.tihonovich@trinidad.co.gov>

Subject: RE: E911 Bjlls for December Payment : ;
IS Sé Ematls haveBeen approved by the board and entered into the minutes on

January 26, 2023.

W _— January 26, 2023
Sent from my T-Mobile 4G LTE Device
Gabriel Moreno, Chairperson

———————— Original message --------
From: Barbara Fisk <barbara.f@tadems.com>




